Interoffice Memorandum

City Manager’s Office
TO: Mayor Holic and City Council Members
FROM: Edward F. Lavallee, City Manager
RE: December 12, 2017, Consent Agenda Item No. 17-3008, Request the Purchase of

Five (5) 2018 Chevrolet Tahoes

DATE: December 11, 2017

Attached please find additional backup material for subject agenda item.
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TO: Ed Lavallee, City Manager
FROM:  Tom Mattmuller, Chief W
DATE: December 6, 2017

MEETING DATE: December 12, 2017

SUBJECT: Utilize the Florida Sheriff’s Association Bid (#FSA17-VEL25.0) 1n the
Amount of $159,447 to Purchase — (5} 2018 Chevrolet Tahoes

Bsc nd:

I request the Mayor’s and City Council’s approval to utilize the Flonda Shenffs
Association Bid (#FSA17-VEL25.0), cooperative purchasing agreement for the
purchase of five (5) Chevrolet Tahoes through the authorized dealer of C ‘ber
Chevrolet-Buick-GMC Truck. The Flonda Sheriff’s Association Bid is the best venue
to use to purchase these vehicles as it 1s on state-wide contract and all dealerships who
are interested in bidding may do so. Quotes were sought from local dealerships,
however they could not match the prices of the bid. The vehicles on bid are equipped
with police packa s that local dealers cannot provide. It 1s cost effective and a sound
business practice to utilize the bid for these purchases.

These vehicles are 2018 two-wheel drive, four door Chevrolet Tahoes with the added
Police package. These v« cles will 1 _ lace older VPD Patrol Units# 81 and 94, which
are recommended for disposal because of mechanical issues. Additior ~ vehicle
disposals will be determined at a date closer to the delivery of the new patrol vehicles.
Useable equipment will be stripped frv . older units before they are sent to  iction.
Please see the attached memo from the Fleet Manager justifying the purchase of these
Tahoes and for the disposal of Units #81 and #94.

Four (4) of the vehicles have an identical cost of $31,865 each for a total of $127 30.
The fifth velicle is an unmarked vehicle at a cost of $31,987 for a grand total of
$159, 7.The Gity s utihzingthist  } wseofthe :onormnics of s id | y
_ wer of the Flonda Shedffs Association nd and contracts.









Alan Jay Nissan, Inc.

Alan Jay Toyota

Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines

Auto Nation Nissan Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

Bartow Ford

Bay N~dge Ch='~~ '~2p Ram
Beck Auto Sales, Inc.

Bruce's Rossmavar'c Navtana Harlav Navidenan

Coggin Ford

Duval Ford LLC

Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

Garher Chruclar Dodgn lapn Inm

Garber Ford

Kelley Buick GMC, Inc

Prestige Ford

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Stingray Chevrolet LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Terry Taylor's Deland Nissan
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FSA17-VEH15.0 Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Bid Tabulation

Ring Power Corporation $31,162.00 $31,162.00 $31,162.00 -- No bid --
Kelly Tractor -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -« No bid -- $22,268.00
Ring Power Corporation $33,083.00 $33,083.00 $33,083.00 $33,083.00
Southern States Material Handling $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00 $22,635.00

#67. SCISSOR LIFT - SELF PROPELLED

Ring Power Corporation $12,540.00 $12,540.00 $12,540.00 -- No bid --
Kelly Tractor -- No bid -- -~ No bid -- -- No bid -- $11,285.00
Federal Contracts Corp $13,192.00 $13,192.00 $13,192.00 $13,192.00
Ridge Equipment Co. Inc. $12,378.00 $11,978.00 $11,978.00 $11,978.00
Southern States Material Handling $11,725.00 $11,725.00 $11,831.00 $11,990.00
Kelly Tractor -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $13,635.00 $13,635.00

#68. RUBBER TIRE MATERIAL HANDLER, 48,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT

GS Equipment, Inc, $267,378.00 $267,378.00 $267,378.00 $267,378.00
Ring Power Corporation $259,660.00 $259,660.00 $259,660.00 -- No bid --
Kelly Tractor -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $258,006.00

#69. HYBRID LIGHT TOWER

Tradewinds Power Corp $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00
#70. LIGHT TOWER - TRAILER MOUNTED

Doosan Portable Power $7,132.00 $7,132.00 $7,132.00 $7,132.00
ACF Standby Systesm $9,369.00 $9,369.00 $9,369.00 $9,369.00
Federal Contracts Corp $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00
Kelly Tractor -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $8,965.00 $8,965.00

#71. 125KW GENERATOR PACKAGE

Zabatt Power Systems $30,468.00 $30,468.00 $30,468.00 $30,468.00
Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $27,800.00 $27,800.00 $27,800.00
Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $41,000.00

Ring Power Corporation $41,745.00 $41,745.00 $41,745.00 -- No bid --



FSA17-VEH15.0 Cab & Chassis & Other Fleet Equipment Bid Tabulation

Doosan Portable Power

ACF Standby Systesm

Tradewinds Power Corp

Kelly Tractor

$72,469.00

$36,600.00

$41,173.00

-- No bid --

#72. 150KW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE

Zabatt Power Systems

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Doosan Portable Power

ACF Standby Systesm

Federal Contracts Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Kelly Tractor
#73. 500kW GENERATOR PACKAGE

Zabatt Power Systems

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Pantropic Power
Ring Power Corporation

ACF Standby Systesm

Tradewinds Power Corp

$50,500.00

$81,200.00

$79,569.00

$87,100.00

$104,505.00

$73,220.00

-- No bid --

$88,780.00

$83,700.00

-- No bid --
$119,366.00

$89,900.00

$102,752.00

#74. 500kW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Pantropic Power
Ring Power Corporation

Tradewinds Power Corp

$180,300.00

-- No bid --
$283,320.00

$198,263.00

$72,469.00

$36,600.00

$41,173.00

-- No bid --

$50,500.00

$81,200.00

$79,569.00

$87,100.00

$104,505.00

$73,220.00

-- No bid --

$88,780.00

$83,700.00

-- No bid --
$119,366.00

$89,900.00

$102,752.00

$180,300.00

-- No bid --
$283,320.00

$198,263.00

$72,469.00

$36,600.00

$41,173.00

$83,978.00

7z
$50,500.00 °

7
$79,569.00 *

$87,100.00

$104,505.00

7

$73,220.00

$102,190.00

$88,780.00

$83,700.00

-- No bid --

$119,366.00

$89,900.00

$102,752.00

$180,300.00

-- No bid --

$283,320.00

$198,263.00

$72,469.00

$36,600.00

$41,173.00

$83,978.00

$50,500.00

$81,200.00

$79,569.00

$87,100.00

$104,505.00

$73,220.00

$102,190.00

$88,780.00

$83,700.00

$120,000.00
-- No bid --

$89,900.00

$102,752.00

$180,300.00

$283,500.00
-- No bid --

$198,263.00
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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Ul{lt
Price

Zabatt Power Systems 2018 AKSA ATI150 * Western $50,500.00
2018 AKSA AT150 Western --NB --

Zabatt Power Systems 2018 AKSA AT150 * Northern $50,500.00
2018 AKSA AT150 Northern --NB --

Zabatt Power Systems 2018 AKSA ATI150 * Central $50,500.00
2018 AKSA AT150 Central --NB --

Zabatt Power Systems 2018 AKSA ATI150 * Southern $50,500.00
2018 AKSA AT150 Southern --NB --

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc 12:(,)1_148 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 000y $81,200.00
2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 Western ~NB -
FT4

Mid Florida Diesel, Tnc 12:%8 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 \q o $81,200.00
2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 Northern " NB --
FT4

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc %‘%148 Blue Star Power Systems VD130-02 .y $81,200.00
2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 Central ~NB -
FT4

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc 12:9;18 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 ¢ o $81,200.00
2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD 150-02 Southern NB -
FT4

Doosan Portable Power 2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Western $79,569.00
2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Western --NB --

Doosan Portable Power 2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Northern $79,569.00
2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Northern --NB --

Doosan Portable Power 2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Central $79,569.00
2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F Central --NB --
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Doosan Portable Power

ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Federal Contracts Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Kelly Tractor

Kelly Tractor

2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F
2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F

2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4
2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4

2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F
2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F

2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150
2018 Tradewinds TP150

2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180
2018 Wacker Neuson G180

Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southem

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southem

$79,569.00

$87,100.00
--NB --
$87,100.00
$87,100.00
--NB --
$87,100.00
--NB --

$104,505.00
--NB --
$104,505.00
--NB --
$104,505.00
--NB --
$104,505.00
--NB --

$73,220.00
$73,220.00
$73,220.00
$73,220.00 -

$102,190.00
--NB --
$102,190.00
- NB --
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150KW MOB™ £ GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #72

2018 AKSA AT150

2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 FT4
2018 Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F

2018 Generac/Magnum MDG175DF4

2018 Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F

2018 Tradewinds TP150

2018 Wacker Neuson G180

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. GENERATOR REQUIREMENTS:

a. Standby duty rated at 150kwe, 187kva, 8 power factor.

b. Prime power duty rating 135kwe, 168kva, 0.8 power factor.

c. Main Breaker shall be equipped with shunt trip.

d. Generator end shall be Direct coupled to the engine flywheel with a flexible coupling.
e. Generator shall meet performance class G3 of IEC.

f. Jacket water heater.

2. ENGINE;:

a. 6 cylinder, water cooled, 1800rpm, diesel engine.
b. Current emission compliant diesel engine.
c. Spin on fuel and oil filters.

3.0 T THSTTTTOYTT T VITC™™ ~ DISTRIBUTION:

a. Manual 3 position voltage change over switch to select each voltage as specified when the unit is not running,
b. 1ph 120/240, 3ph 120/240, 3ph 120/208, and 3ph 277/480.

¢. A five point connection shall be provided for ease of connection of load leads.

d. One 50amp, 120/240vac, 1 ph, twist lock receptacle.

e. One 30amp, 120/240vac, 1 ph, RV type receptacle.

f. Two 20amp, 120/240vac, 1 ph, duplex receptacle.

g. Two 20amp, 120/240vac, 1ph, duplex GFI receptacle.

h. Each receptacle shall be protected by a individual circuit breaker.

i. A receptacle shall be provided to power both the jacket water heater and on board battery charger.

j. Two thumb screw type connection points shall be provided for remote auto start.

4. CONTROLS:

a. Solid state, microprocessor based generator controls.
b. Controls shall provide all operating, monitoring and control functions for the generator set. Controls shall provide for

auto start/stop functions.
c. A emergency stop push button will be installed.
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d. A voltage adjustment shall be provided in the panel to adjust voltage in all voltage positions.
e. A switch shall be provided in the panel to turn all power off in the panel if not being used.

5. ENCLOSURE:

a. Complete diesel engine generator set including control panel, engine starting batteries and fuel tank shall be enclosed
in a factory assembled weather protective, sound attenuated enclosure. The sound attenuated enclosure noise level is
not to exceed 73 — 75dba @ 21 feet.

b. Qil and water drain lines shall be provided and extend to the enclosure wall with valves for easy service.

c. Critical grade silencer.

d. Companion flanges.

e. Flexible exhaust-flex.

f. Keyed alike lockable doors.

6. IN BASE FUEL TANK TRATLER:

a. Trailer shall be DOT approved with proper serial number data plate indicating weight capacity minimum of 10,0001bs.
b. Trailer will have dual axles with torque springs to reduce overall height of package.

¢. Standard 7 or 5 pin vehicle hitch receiver to be supplied.

d. Trailer will have two rear level jacks with sand shoes and front leveling jack.

e. Trailer will have hydraulic brakes.

f. Trailer will have all necessary safety equipment to include but not be limited to an adjustable and removable pintle

hitch, 30 inch safety chains, fenders, lights per DOT, and break away cable.

g. Tires will be minimum load range type "D" (8 ply rating) with matching steel rims. Rims are to be finish painted.
h. Minimum 8 hour capacity at 75% load rating to determine single wall tank size.

i. A mechanical fuel gauge will be provided.

j. Locking fuel cap.

k. Low fuel level alarm.

1. All necessary vents and caps will be provided along with suction, return, and drain points.

7. BATTERY CHARGER:

a. Battery will be installed in holding container with battery cables.

b. Current limiting battery charger to automatically charge batteries.

c¢. Charger shall be dual charge rate with automatic switching to boost rate when required.
d. Charger mounted inside generator set package.

e. Fully charged battery will be provided at time of delivery and start-up.

8 START UP & COMMISSIONING:

a. One (1) day start-up including operational test of equipment showing proper connection of cables with safety issues
performed by a factory trained technician. The start up technician will instruct personnel how to operate and maintain
the equipment in accordance with the manufacturer's requirements.

9. CONDITIONS:

a. In addition to equipment specified, each generator shall be equipped with all standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and shall include but not be limited to the following items:

b. All product shall be new and of current design.

c. Initial filling of oil and antifreeze. (diesel fuel by others)

d. During start-up, the technician shall record the following information and provide to owner for his records:

e.-Operating Voltage, Hertz, Phase, and connected load (Amperage). [if any]

f. Package information consisting of Make of generator (Cat, Wacker, or Tradewinds), Model (TJ125 TP20, DP125,
etc.), Serial number of complete package, and Start-up date.

g. Written Information consisting of make, model, serial number, and start-up date.

h. Record Engine and Generator Serial numbers.

i. One complete set of operation and maintenance manuals.

j. Two (2) year or 1500 hour standard mobile generator warranty will apply. Generator to be transported to authorized
servicing dealer for warranty repair during normal business hours.

10. TRAILER

a. The trailer must have a vin and a certificate of origin
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DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT
DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT
THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE
PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A
CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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150KW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #72

2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 FT4

The Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 FT4 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $81,200.00 $81,200.00 $81,200.00 $81,200.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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150KW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #72

2018 Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 FT4
(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Blue Star Power Systems VD150-02 FT4 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by
the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract’s vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Name of Dealership

Zabatt Power Systems

Zabatt Power Systems

Zabatt Power Systems

Zabatt Power Systems

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Pantropic Power

WSOCIATION OF
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e e
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCTIATION OF COUNTIES

Type of Vehicle Zone
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Western
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Western
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Northern
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Northern
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Central
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Central
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Southern
2018 AKSA ULJ-125 Southern

2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 * Western
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 Western
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 % Northern
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 Northern
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 * Central
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 Central
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 * Southern
2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 Southern

2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Western
2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Western
2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Northern
2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Northern
2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Central

2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Central

2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Southern
2018 Caterpillar D125-8 Southern
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F Western
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F Western
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F Northern

Base Unit
Price

$30,468.00
--NB --
$30,468.00
—-NB --
$30,468.00
- NB --
$30,468.00
-NB --

$27,800.00
--NB --
$27,800.00
--NB --
$27,800.00
--NB --
$27,800.00
--NB --

$41,000.00
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ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

ACF Standby Systesm

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

Tradewinds Power Corp

2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F
2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F

2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130
2018 Generac SD130

2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125
2018 Tradewinds TP125

2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150
2018 Wacker G150

Northern
Central
Central
Southern
Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

--NB --
—-NB --
- NB --
--NB --
- NB --

$36,600.00
--NB --
$36,600.00
- NB --
$36,600.00
--NB --
$36,600.00

$41,173.00
--NB --
$41,173.00
- NB --
$41,173.00
- NB --
$41,173.00
--NB --

--NB --
--NB --
- NB --
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125KW GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #71

2018 AKSA ULJ-125

2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02
2018 Caterpillar D125-8

2018 Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F

2018 Generac SD130

2018 Tradewinds TP125

2018 Wacker G150

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE
VEHICLE/EQUIPMENT TO MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE
VEHICLE LISTED.

1. GENERATOR REQUIREMENTS:

a. Standby duty rated at 125.0 kW, 156.3 KVA, 8 power factor.

b. 480 volts

¢. 3 phase, 60 hertz, 1800 rpm

d. Directly connected to the engine flywheel housing with flex coupling.
e. Generator shall meet performance class G3 of IEC.

f. Unit shall be in compliance with and be UL 2200 labeled.

2. ENGINE:

a. Water cooled diesel engine, sized for generator set.
b. Emission compliant engine.

3. CONTROLS:

a. Solid state, microprocessor based generator controls.
b. Controls shall provide all operating, monitoring and control functions for generator set.

4. ENCI OSURE/SILENCER:

a. Complete diesel engine generator set including control panel, engine starting batteries and fuel oil tank shall be
enclosed in a factory assembled water protective, sound attenuated enclosure.

b. Critical grade silencer.

¢. Companion flanges.

d. Flexible stainless steel exhaust.

a. Double wall sub-base tank integral to enclosure.
b. 24 hour capacity at 100% at full load.

¢. Rupture basin with 110% capacity.

d. Locking fuel caps.

e. Mechanical fuel level gauge.
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f. Low fuel level alarm contact.
g. Fuel tank rupture alarm contact.
h. Must meet UL 142 and FDEP standards.

6. BATTERY CHARGER:

a. Current limiting battery charger to automatically charge batteries.
b. Charger shall be dual charge rate with automatic switching to boost rate when required.
c¢. Charger shall be mounted on genset package.

7. START UP AND TEST™ ",

a. Vendor must coordinate all start up and testing activities with the engineer and owner. After installation is completed
by others and normal power is available, the vendor must perform a one (1) day start-up including the use of building
load. The start-up technician will instruct all necessary personnel how to operate and maintain the equipment in
accordance to the manufacturer's requirements.

8. CONDITIONS:

a. In addition to equipment specified, each generator shall be equipped with all standard equipment as specified by the
manufacture for this model and shall include but not be limited to the following necessary items:

b. Initial filling of oil and antifreeze.

¢. Shrink wrap applied to the product to ensure a clean finish.

d. During the start-up, the technician shall record the following information and provide to the owner for his records:

¢. Record Operating Voltage, Hz, Ph, and connected load (Amperage)

f. Package information consisting of Make of generator (Cat, Wacker, or Tradewinds), Model (TJ125 TP20, DP125,
etc.), Serial number of complete package, and Start-up date.

¢. Record engine and generator serial numbers.

h. One complete set of operation and maintenance manuals.

i. Two (2) year or 1500 hour standard standby generator warranty. Labor, materials, and travel for the warranty period
repair will be paid by manufacturer during normal business hours.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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125 KW GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #71

2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02

The Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: * Western * Northemn * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $27,800.00 $27,800.00 $27,800.00 $27,800.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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125KW GENERATOR PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #71

2018 Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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