Lori Stelzer

From: Robert Daniels

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2014 6:39 PM

To: Edward Lavallee; Tom McNulty

Cc: City Council; Jeff Shrum; crobinso@scgov.net; Lori Stelzer; David
<dpersson@sarasotalawfirm.com>

Subject: Special Event Costs......County....Agenda Item

Attachments: image001.jpg

Ed, per our discussion | contacted the county for information on how they evaluate and charge for special events. This
information should be very helpful as we look at our event costs and how we charge.

Below is the Sheriff's costs.

I have fire and public works and will send in another e-mail.

Lori, please place county information with the agenda topic.

Much thanks to the county for sharing their information with us.

Regards,
Councilman Bob Daniels
Venice, Florida

Begin forwarded message:

From: Steve Burns <sburns@scgov.net>

Date: February 25, 2014 at 4:23:07 PM EST

To: Christine Robinson <crobinso@scgov.net>, "rdaniels@venicegov.com" <rdaniels@venicegov.com>
Subject: Sheriff's Office---Specail Detail Program

Commissioner Robinson and Council Member Daniels,

Chief Tobias advised that you were inquiring about specifics regarding our special detail program as it
relates to special events across the county. Please peruse what | have below and if you have any further
questions or concerns feel free to contact me personally.

Public Service Aide (civilian) $29/hr.

Deputy $35/hr.

Sergeant $40/hr.

Lieutenant $44/hr.

Marked Vehicle (required for traffic related events) $10.00/hr.
¢ 3 hour minimum — An employee can work less than 3 hours but must be paid for 3 hours
e 5-9 deputies require the hiring of a sergeant
e 10-14 deputies require the hiring of a sergeant and lieutenant

As to the determination of public safety requirements for a particular event, that can vary depending on
the event. Typically an event organizer will either contact the sheriff's office directly or go through
County Planning to obtain a permit. Once the sheriff’s office is notified, we will review all aspects of the
event. There really is no set formula on how many deputies/officers to staff an event. We look at a
number of factors that include; type of event, venue, expected attendance, environmental factors,
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alcohol permitted, prior similar events, etc. We then use the training and experience of our staff to
outline a staffing plan to effectively handle all probable issues that may occur.

Hope this is what you are looking for.

[x]

Colonel Steve Burns
Chief Deputy

2071 Ringling Blvd
Sarasota, FL 34237
941.861.4046 Office
941.915.4008 Cell
941.861.4009 Fax
sburns@scgov.net
www.SarasotaSheriff.org

Find us on Facebook
www.facebook.com/SarasotaCountySheriff

“‘Please Note: All mail to and from the Sarasota County Sheriff's Office is subject to the

Public Records Law of Florida.”

Please note: This agency is a public entity and is subject to Chapter 119, Florida Statutes,

concerning public records. Email communications are covered under such laws; therefore, email

sent or received on this entity's computer system, including your email address, may be disclosed

to the public and media upon request. If you do not want your email address released to a public

records request, do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or

in writing,
PLEASE NOTE: This agency is a public entity and is subject to Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, concerning
public records. Email communications are covered under such laws; therefore, email sent or received on this
entity's computer system, including your email address, may be disclosed to the public and media upon request.
If you do not want your email address released to a public records request, do not send electronic mail to this
entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.



Lori Stelzer
e e e

From: Robert Daniels

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2014 6:41 PM

To: Edward Lavallee; James Warman

Cc: City Council; Lori Stelzer; David <dpersson@sarasotalawfirm.com>; crobinso@scgov.net
Subject: Special Event Costs.....County Fire

Ed, here is the fire costs for our discussion.

Regards,
Councilman Bob Daniels
Venice , Florida

Begin forwarded message:

From: Mike Tobias <mtobias@scgov.net>

Date: February 19, 2014 at 12:35:40 PM EST

To: Christine Robinson <crobinso@scgov.net>
To: Robert Daniels <RDaniels(@venicegov.com>
Cc: ACAs <ACAs@scgov.net>

Cec: Robin Bayus <rbayus@scgov.net>

Cc: Public Records Request <PublicRecords@scgov.net>
Cc: Commissioners <Commissioners@scgov.net>
Cc: Carolyn Brown <cnbrown@scgov.net>

Ce: Tom Harmer <tharmer@scgov.net>

Subject: RE: Special Event Costs

Good Afternoon Commissioners and Vice Mayor

We are advised of the events along with other County agencies through the Temporary Use Permit
(TUP) procedure.

Currently Sarasota County Fire Department charges the following rates for special event coverage under
Resolution 2003-318:

Fire Engine: $45 per hour

Ladder Truck: $45 per hour

Brush Truck: $35 per hour

Special Operations Squad: $45 per hour
Command Vehicle: $8.50 per hour
Ambulance: $21 per hour

Fire Boat: $27 per hour

Personnel costs: Actual wage of personnel

We determine the coverage needed on factors including: number of participants, location and
geography of event, type of event, weather conditions, time of day, number of days, likelihood of
injuries and other factors such as alcohol being served.
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I am not familiar with the Sheriff’s special event operations, so | forwarded your email to Colonel Burns
and asked him to reply to you.

Please let me know if you have any other questions.
Thank you
Mike Tobias

From: Christine Robinson

Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2014 9:14 AM
To: 'Robert Daniels'; Carolyn Brown; Mike Tobias
Cc: ACAs; Robin Bayus; Public Records Request
Subject: RE: Special Event Costs

Dear Vice Mayor Daniels,

Thank you for your e-mail. The e-mail body came through as an attachment so I
have copied and pasted the questions below and highlighted them for easier access
to staff.

Best Regards,
Christine

Christine Robinson
County Commissioner
1660 Ringling Boulevard
Sarasota, Florida 34236
PH: 941-861-5727
crobinson@scgov.net
WWW.SCgoV. het

Assisted by Robin Bayus
RBayusf@scgov.net

7d

I observe the Civility Rule: I will conduct myself in a civil manner in all
communications and will require, and expect, the same of individuals
communicating with me.

All e-mail sent and received is subject to the public records laws of the State
of Florida

What are the charges if the event requires fire or police?Also how do you determine if the event
requires public safety at the event?

Regards,
Councilman Bob Daniels
Venice , Florida



Lori Stelzer

From: Robert Daniels

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2014 6:45 PM

To: Edward Lavallee; John Veneziano

Cc: crobinso@scgov.net; City Council; David <dpersson@sarasotalawfirm.com>; Lori
Stelzer; Linda Kenfield

Subject: Special Event Costs....County Parks

Attachments: image001.gif; ATT00001.htm; Zoning Temporary Use Permit Application.pdf;
ATT00002.htm

Ed, here is Parks costs for us to review

Regards,
Councilman Bob Daniels
Venice , Florida

Begin forwarded message:

From: Carolyn Brown <cnbrown@scgov.net>

Date: February 19, 2014 at 9:42:56 AM EST

To: Christine Robinson <crobinso@scgov.net>

To: Robert Daniels <RDaniels@venicegov.com>

To: Mike Tobias <mtobias@scgov.net>

Cc: ACAs <ACAs@scgov.net>

Cec: Robin Bayus <rbayus@scgov.net>

Cc: Public Records Request <PublicRecords@scgov.net>
Cc: BCC <BCC@scgov.net>

Subject: RE: Special Event Costs

Good Morning,

Within Sarasota County, there is a Temporary Use Permit Process (application is attached) where large
events, those with large tents, the use of port-o-lets etc.. must be reviewed by multiple departments
including the Sheriff's Office, Fire, Zoning etc... If it is determined that Paramedics or Sheriff’s Deputies
are needed during an event, charges would be based on the quantity and the type of coverage

needed. Unless it is a County sponsored event, the fees associated with these services would be paid by
the organization or individual requesting the event.

The various municipalities within the County have their separate rules and protocols that must be
followed.

Please let me know if | have answered your questions or if you are seeking more information. | am
always happy to help.

Carolyn



